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Abstract 
 

Soft law is a set of rules and guidelines, the legal force of which is at the “negotiation” stage. It has ap-
peared in international law since the 1970s as one alternative to international treaties, used in cases where, 
for various reasons, the parties do not want or cannot commonly decide or to sign an international treaty. 
Agreements of this kind do not create legal obligations between the contracting parties (under the princi-
ple, contracts must be respected) but only set political obligations, observing which is at the discretion of 
the parties. The primary purpose of the study is to analyze the philosophy of “soft law” in the context of 
international management of relations. The principal object of the research is the essence and significance 
of the philosophy of “soft law” as such. The major results of our research are to determine the essence and 
significance of the philosophy of “soft law” in the context of international relations. 
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Introduction 
 

The development of the international legal 
order shows a gradual modification of the forms 
and methods of legal regulation of the system of 
international relations. Their dynamics is reflect-
ed in the ramified system of international legal 
norms. Now there is a discussion about the es-
sence of such a phenomenon as “soft law” be-
cause the philosophy of “soft law” is a kind of 
point for the collision of opposing ideas and 
views of scientists. It is rather difficult to develop 
a unified approach to understanding this concept 
in view of the fact that the philosophy of “soft 
law” is a complex phenomenon of a complex 
nature with an undefined range of essential fea-
tures today (Zalesny, Goncharov, & Savchenko, 
2019). 

Changes, in our time, are taking place in the 
international system, affect all its components, 

including international law. It seems that our 
generation is witnessing a change in the system 
of international relations, which was formed 
mainly after the Second World War, to a new 
one, with other subjects and rules of interaction. 
This poses new challenges for international law. 
It should act as the main regulator of internation-
al relations to prevent international disputes and 
their effective solution. However, the modern 
system of international law, because of its static 
nature and complex mechanisms of law-making, 
increasingly demonstrates the inability to quickly 
and effectively meet the needs of the internation-
al community. In this situation, actors of the in-
ternational system, both public and private, are 
trying to find more effective tools. It is to such 
mechanisms that the so-called “soft law” or soft 
law can be attributed (Kryshtanovych, Petrov-
skyi, Khomyshyn, Bezena, & Serdechna, 2020). 
Philosophy of “soft law” entered the nomencla-
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ture of international law back in the seventies of 
the twentieth century, provoking serious discus-
sions in the scientific community, both about the 
very fact of its existence and about its definition, 
content and functions. These discussions are still 
ongoing, which confirms the relevance of the 
relevant research. 

The generalized approach to defining the es-
sence of the philosophy of “soft law” allows us 
to speak of it as a set of legally non-binding in-
ternational norms created by states, international 
organizations and other entities, do not contradict 
the general principles of international law and are 
aimed at regulating international relations. Inter-
national law establishes certain limits for the ex-
istence of soft law. In return, the latter contrib-
utes to its development, codification and im-
provement, thus exercising a significant impact 
on international law as a whole. 

 
Methodology 

 
The methodological basis of this scientific ar-

ticle was formed by the most important ap-
proaches, methods and principles of historical 
research. Also, this article about the philosophy 
of “soft law” was used: general scientific meth-
ods (formal-logical, systemic, structural-func-
tional, concrete-historical); general logical meth-
ods of theoretical analysis (analysis, synthesis, 
generalization, comparison, abstraction, analogy, 
modelling, etc.); private, scientific methods 
(technical analysis, specification, interpretation, 
etc.). 

 
Research Results and Discussions 

 
The development of the global information 

society requires the development of new ap-
proaches to international legal regulation, taking 
into account the peculiarities of cyberspace and 
the challenges of the digital era. Globalization 
processes in the modern world are inextricably 
linked with the establishment of the information 
society and the spread of information and com-

munication technologies, in turn, leads to the 
emergence of a new type of legal relationship, 
the settlement of which, due to the application of 
existing international legal mechanisms and 
norms, turned out to be a difficult task. The in-
ternational law of the XXI century should be a 
“living” instrument, reacting as quickly as possi-
ble to changes in the information ecosystem 
(Brading, 2002). 

The philosophy of “soft law” is characterized 
by flexibility, openness to changes and a high 
degree of adaptability to changes associated with 
the development and complication of the subject 
of regulation. Soft law acts can be declarations 
and resolutions, codes of conduct and best prac-
tices, recommendations and guidelines, and the 
like. The dominance of legally binding interna-
tional legal instruments has long ignored an ex-
tensive array of soft law acts. However, the 
emergence of the concept of the global informa-
tion society and attempts to regulate it have 
raised the issue of the effectiveness of the soft in-
ternational legal regulation of this sphere of legal 
relations. The technical orientation of most regu-
latory legal acts on the information society re-
quires deep knowledge and understanding of in-
frastructure characteristics. Therefore states 
could transfer to the level of technical communi-
ties the functions of developing appropriate stan-
dards and rules of conduct with their subsequent 
recognition as fair and appropriate. 

An interesting example of the European Un-
ion, within which soft law rules began to spread, 
especially after adopting the 2000 Lisbon Action 
Plan, which introduced an open method of coor-
dination. This method provided for the develop-
ment of soft law acts, and voluntary cooperation 
in specific areas should have become an alterna-
tive to coercive legal prescriptions. The EU has 
made repeated attempts to create the most effec-
tive governance system based on a combination 
of soft and hard legal regulations. In the EU con-
text, the effectiveness of soft law remedies can 
be measured by assessing the extent to which it 
has been possible to achieve harmonization of 
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regulation in the relevant areas at the suprana-
tional level (Köchler, 2016). Traditionally, direc-
tives that member states have implemented into 
national legislation have been considered binding 
EU acts. However, difficulties arose even when 
states believed that their sovereign rights were 
too limited in favour of supranational bodies. 
Given the technical orientation of a significant 
part of legal acts related to certain aspects of the 
functioning of the information society, it is nec-
essary to provide as for the most flexible mecha-
nism for viewing them and making appropriate 
changes and amendments to them. It is precisely 
such a mechanism that is capable of providing 
soft law. 

Supporters of the hybridity of international 
legal regulation advocate a combination of tradi-
tional hard law and soft legal processes. While 
highlighting the benefits of soft law as an organic 
social product, efficacy and pluralistic respect for 
diversity, they argue that it can be more effective 
when combined with hard law. Hybrids can take 
many forms. Preference is given to combining 
open coordination processes with framework 
directives. In this way, soft law acts as a “living 
law” that complements traditional rigid norms. 
Hard-soft hybrids are considered highly effective 
combinations: their soft components guarantee 
organic responsiveness to social needs, promote 
pluralism and participation, and intensify mutual 
learning; hard elements provide a higher level of 
regulatory compliance by eliminating the ability 
to ignore soft regulations that effectively correct 
the asymmetry between market harmonization 
and social inclusion. An interesting example of a 
combination of soft and hard legal regulation is 
the EU directives, in the text of which several 
specific measures are prescribed, which by their 
nature are temporary soft regulation. Thus, Di-
rective 2000/31 / EC on electronic commerce has 
enshrined several legal provisions to create a sin-
gle European e-commerce market. At the same 
time, the document contains a minimum of re-
quirements for information service providers, 
and it is noted that the member states and the 

Commission should encourage the development 
of codes of conduct and provide an opportunity 
for interested parties to freely decide whether to 
adhere to the provisions of such codes. This 
mixed approach used by the EU has several ad-
vantages. First, at the time of the Directive's 
adoption, there was no understanding of the spe-
cifics of the development of e-commerce in the 
information society. Thus, the EU has secured 
itself against the application of too burdensome 
legal regulations in European firms when they 
carry out operations on the global market on the 
Internet and has just begun to gain momentum. 
Secondly, given the rapid pace of technological 
progress, the EU was trying to create such a legal 
framework; it would not have to be looked at in 
the short term just because they have a deterrent 
effect in relation to those legal relations that are 
intended to regulate. Thirdly, it was an attempt to 
create a better regulatory mechanism compared 
to the telecommunications sector (Finnis, 2014). 

When concluding international treaties, states 
are often reluctant to agree to assume obliga-
tions, significantly limiting their sovereign rights, 
especially for the creation of supranational bod-
ies, to whose jurisdiction part of the powers of 
states in certain areas is transferred. Soft law al-
lows states to minimise the risks of limiting their 
sovereignty by adopting non-binding rules and 
creating international institutions or organiza-
tions with clearly defined delegated powers. 
Vague formulations and weak institutional me-
chanisms fulfil a protective function of state sov-
ereignty. An example is the Council of Europe 
Framework Convention for protecting National 
Minorities. 

The global information society is a new and 
rather complex area for regulation in the history 
of modern international law. States, as a rule, are 
not sufficiently well and comprehensively famil-
iar with the peculiarities of the functioning of the 
digital environment, and therefore at this stage, it 
is difficult to talk about the development of legal-
ly binding international legal documents. First, 
there is a need to clearly understand the benefits 
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and dangers of cyberspace and the use of ICTs. 
In this case, it would be possible to delegate 
broad powers in the information sphere to the 
same International Telecommunication Union or 
to any other international organization responsi-
ble for developing appropriate standards and le-
gal norms. However, by doing so, states are ac-
tually weakening their sovereign rights in such a 
critical area as cyberspace and the information 
society. At the present stage, the insufficient lev-
el of knowledge of legal relations in the infor-
mation sphere is the reason for the adoption of 
the framework and declarative international legal 
documents (Mutua, 2002). 

The adoption philosophy of “soft law” always 
facilitates the process of reaching a compromise 
solution. In addition, non-binding international 
legal documents allow states to adapt their obli-
gations in specific circumstances, much more 
practical than attempts to unify various and often 
contradictory national practices in a single doc-
ument. Thus, states get wide scope for the im-
plementation of the agreement while simultane-
ously adjusting it to the political and economic 
environment within the country, which in turn 
increases the efficiency of law enforcement. This 
is especially true when it comes to multilateral 
negotiations. Here it should be noted that multi-
lateral participation is recognized as one of the 
basic principles of cyberspace, and therefore the 
adoption of soft law acts as a result of such nego-
tiations is an absolutely natural process. The pre�
sence of the political interest of states always 
makes it difficult to reach a compromise. The ab�
sence of any legal regulation cannot be consid-
ered a better alternative even compared to legally 
non-binding soft law acts (Ordukhanyan, 2019). 

The history of international law shows that 
lengthy negotiations on key international treaties 
often end with the adoption of texts in which 
states make many reservations or refuse to sign 
or ratify them altogether. As a result, we have a 
full-fledged international treaty that lacks effec-
tive law enforcement. Moreover, without this, 
the international treaty is dead. After all, its pri-

mary purpose should be the settlement of a spe-
cific type of legal relationship with the participa-
tion of a wider range of subjects. In addition, in 
the context of the global information society, 
special attention is paid to developing countries, 
which, unfortunately, do not have sufficient lev-
erage in the development and adoption of legally 
binding international documents. They also lack 
the appropriate institutional mechanisms for the 
implementation of the relevant international trea-
ties. The multilateral participation regime allows 
such states to be heard and defend their interests, 
which will be enshrined in international docu-
ments, although in the form of soft law. Subse-
quently, the relevant provisions will be much 
easier to translate into the category of legally 
binding than to try to reach a consensus on them 
in the course of initial negotiations with stronger 
and more developed states. 

The growing role of non-state actors in the 
process of international lawmaking cannot be 
denied either. The overwhelming majority of 
documents, now regulating a whole range of is-
sues related to the information society, were de-
veloped precisely in the course of multilateral 
negotiations with the involvement of all interest-
ed parties. In addition, the private sector plays an 
essential role in the development of regulatory 
standards for investment, human rights and envi-
ronmental protection. In fact, transnational law is 
being created to understand which the signifi-
cance of state borders as a territorial basis for the 
spread of the relevant jurisdiction is completely 
levelled. In addition, a large number of interna-
tional dispute resolution bodies accept com-
plaints from both states and private applicants. 
Another argument in favour of soft international 
legal regulation may be the fact that in practice, 
there are widespread cases when the actions of 
the state differ significantly from the legal obli-
gations assumed under international law. 

Obviously, even a soft law framework docu-
ment will be more effective than an international 
treaty if its enforcement becomes a logical con-
tinuation of the will of the subjects. Such infor-
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mal agreements do not require subsequent ratifi-
cation and any additional approval, and therefore 
immediately become the object of direct law en-
forcement. States, being the primary subjects of 
international law, are not without flaws. Thus, 
the representation of governments always takes 
place with the participation of the ruling parties, 
often guided by their own interests with the sup-
port of certain international legal initiatives. In 
some places, they may not go out of the position 
of the national interest but, on the contrary, pro-
mote formulations that are beneficial for the pri-
vate sector or certain political groups in ex-
change for their support in the elections. A large 
number of soft law acts on issues of the global 
information society can also be explained by the 
fact that the most interested parties, such as in-
ternational non-governmental organizations, the 
private sector, civil society, communities of In-
ternet users, do not have an international legal 
personality that would guarantee them the right 
to participate in international treaties (Kazan-
chian, 2020). 

The philosophy of “soft law” itself is en-
dowed with high normative value. It should not 
be seen only as a possible step towards the adop-
tion of legally binding acts of international law. 
As the analysis shows, soft law acts can fill the 
legal vacuum and become an effective means of 
international legal regulation in those areas 
where states cannot or do not want to agree on 
certain issues. The novelty of the global informa-
tion society concept takes some time to under-
stand through its key components, characteris-
tics, and features. Only as a result of this will it 
be possible to develop legally binding interna-
tional legal norms. 

Consequently, regardless of whether we clas-
sify an international legal norm as soft or hard, it 
does not cease to be legal in nature. Everything 
else is just additional grounds for theoretical dis-
cussions. In practice, the only thing that matters 
is that soft law rules on the issues of the global 
information society are fulfilled because those 
subjects whose rights and interests are directly 

affected and regulated by such rules take part in 
their development. 

The philosophy of “soft law” has several ad-
vantages and characteristics, which we have 
formed due to our analysis. 

First, the rules of philosophy of “soft law” can 
fix elements of a rule-making process or state 
that a consensus has been reached on a future 
treaty or act. Second, the rules of “soft” law can 
interpret and complement the rules of “hard” 
law. They can play an important role in bridging 
regulatory gaps and resolving disputes between 
parties. Thirdly, the rules of “soft law” can fix 
the parties‟ consent on a certain issue without 
making commitments. In the process of its crea-
tion, the expression of the subjects‟ will concern 
only the content of such a norm but does not 
concern the issue of its binding, which allows 
avoiding legal liability for failure to comply with 
such a rule (Michael, 1992).  

The transformation of social relations, which 
is now taking place because of European integra-
tion and globalization processes, inevitably leads 
to reformatory transformations in various spheres 
of human activity and, accordingly, to changes in 
legal reality. It is in the integration‟s context and 
convergence of legal systems, as well as the de-
velopment of the information society, of great 
importance, not only to study the practical as-
pects of improving the legal regulation of public 
relations, but also to rethink the content of the 
legal doctrine, which, absorbing the ideas of hu-
man centrism, is gradually moving from classical 
positivism and natural law in the new democrati-
cally liberal concept of law, the central place in 
which is the protection of the interests of a per-
son, society as a whole and various social unions 
(Dang, Jasovska, & Rammal, 2020). In such con-
ditions, it is important to unify legal ideas and 
thoughts by strengthening the connection be-
tween positivist and natural legal views of legal 
scholars, the formation and application of a new 
strategy for the study of law, which is based on a 
free approach to law, based and formed in the 
concept of “living law” by Evgeny Erlikh even at 
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the turn of the nineteenth and twentieth centuries. 
Taking into account modern trends in law, we 
should talk about the understanding of law 
through the prism of social manifestations, re-
search of its social nature because the sociologi-
cal theory of legal thinking today is gaining more 
and more relevance among scientists and is be-
coming one of the main in jurisprudence (Labar-
ca & Ampuero Ruiz, 2020). 

The emergence of the concept of soft law is 
associated with the objective qualities inherent in 
the international regulatory system. First of all, 
this is the absence of a single centre of rule-ma�
king, a single hierarchy of sources of internation-
al law, the conciliatory nature of international 
law. 

An important point is a way in which the 
norms of international law are formed. At the 
heart of each rule is the agreed expression of the 
will of the states concerning two points (Pitts, 
2020):  
1. the content of the norm;  
2. a decision on its obligation.  

The way of formulating the rules of conduct 
is reminiscent of the text of an international trea-
ty. However, in this case, one cannot speak about 
the content of the legal obligation. The parties 
reached an agreed expression of will regarding 
the content of the rule and the very fact of its ex-
istence but did not reach it on the recognition of 
this rule as legally binding. The rule is enshrined 
in a document that is recommendatory according 
to the UN Charter. Thus, the rule of “soft law” 
does not have the second feature of a legal 
norm - the property of formal certainty. By virtue 
of this, the content of the “soft law” norms is not 
the rights and obligations of the parties in the 
international legal sense. If the rule of interna-
tional law is provided internationally by coer-
cion, then this cannot be said concerning the rule 
of soft law. The parties are deprived of the op�
portunity to use legal means of coercion. 

Today we can say that the philosophy of “soft 
law” is gradually penetrating into the sphere of 
domestic regulation. The authority of soft law 

norms, their ability to reflect the modern features 
of the regulation of relations in a certain sphere, 
as well as their wide distribution in the interna-
tional legal system, are taken into account in leg-
islation, increasingly contains blanket provisions, 
refer to acts of soft law (Wang, 2006). 

The case when international courts resort to 
“soft law” testifies to various ways of promoting 
the norms of a non-legal, moral and political na-
ture to legal regulation: filling gaps in law by 
giving definitions and interpreting certain con-
cepts; determination of the content of an interna-
tional custom or confirmation of its existence; 
strengthening legal argumentation by bringing 
expert assessments of authoritative international 
structures in relation to the current controversial 
situation; informing about existing international 
standards and the need to comply with them. Ne�
vertheless, “soft law” reveals shortcomings, 
which are manifested, in particular, in the possi-
ble inconsistency of the provisions contained in 
legally non-binding international acts adopted in 
different periods. Probably, we can admit several 
options for solving this problem, depending on 
the availability of relevant international legal 
norms. It seems that with the existence of the 
latter, the recommendatory act should be corre-
lated with the current legal norms, giving prefer-
ence, of course, to the legal ones, but only those 
of them that are mandatory for the state. Any-
thing else would hinder the free formation of sus-
tainable state practice. In the absence of the re-
quired norms of international law, the lex poste-
rior derogat legi priori principle should probably 
apply. 

It is possible to highlight possible options for 
the meaning of the acts of “soft law”, which de-
termine their place in the European system of 
sources of law:  
1. assistance in interpretation is not necessary, 

which means that the European and national 
institutions can decide for themselves the ex-
pediency or inexpediency of the application 
of acts of “soft or law” when interpreting le-
gal regulations;  
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2. compulsory assistance in interpretation oblig-
es the member states of the European com-
munity to take into account the acts of “soft 
law” in lawmaking and law enforcement ac-
tivities;  

3. ensuring a consistent interpretation provides 
for the obligation of the participating coun-
tries to gradually bring the acts of the national 
legal system in line with the recommenda-
tions and opinions expressed by international 
institutions. So, the concept of “soft law” has 
a number of advantages and allows you to in-
fluence interstate relations despite the rec-
ommendatory nature. They are designed to 
fill the gaps in legislation and bring existing 
legal norms in line with the requirements and 
standards put forward by international bodies 
and organizations (Racelis, 2017). 
Summing up, it is worth noting that the study 

of modern law should be grounded not in the 
interpretation of official law but in the study of 
the legal reality of the present while focusing 
precisely on the relationship and mutual influ-
ence of law and society. The entire “sociology of 
law” by E. Ehrlich aims to substantiate the need 
to study “living” law in the context of the orga-
nized unity of state, social and economic life. 
According to the scientist, “living” law is all 
non-legal norms, at least to some extent involved 
in regulating social relations (even good taste and 
fashion). Such statements lead modern research-
ers of the concept of “living law” to conclude 
that law is determined not by its creation by law-
making bodies but by its functioning in the al-
ready existing public legal relations. That is, the 
understanding of the law cannot be confined only 
to the interpretation of those norms enshrined on 
paper and to its identification with legislation. 
After all, the law as a socio-cultural phenomenon 
includes both the norms of official law and the 
norms produced in law enforcement. Therefore, 
it is important to understand law through the 
prism of lawmaking and law enforcement activi-
ties as inseparable processes, the combination of 
which leads to more effective use of legal means 

in the relevant situation and an individual ap-
proach to the implementation of legal norms for 
the effective and balanced legal regulation of 
public relations. 

 
Conclusion 

 
Summing up, it should be noted that in inter-

national relations philosophy of “soft law” helps 
to fill the gaps in international legal regulation, is 
used in the process of interpreting the provisions 
of international legal treaties and plays a vital 
role in resolving conflicts, because it is a univer-
sal means of maintaining a dialogue between 
states with various foreign policy, economic and 
cultural traditions. 

We wish to emphasize that the concept of 
philosophy of “soft law” is not fully legal, and 
therefore cannot be considered and defined ex-
clusively in the context of international law and 
its instruments. Now the term “soft law” is un-
derstood as a set of heterogeneous norms, both 
legal and non-legal, which can be contained both 
in international treaties and in decisions of inter-
national organisations if they do not establish 
clear legal rights and obligations of states and 
other subjects of international law... These in-
clude norms contained in non-binding parts of 
international treaties or treaties that have not yet 
entered into force, decisions of international or-
ganizations and conferences, and decisions of 
international judicial bodies. In accordance with 
this, “soft law” can be divided into international 
soft law, international legislative soft law and 
international general (judicial) soft law. This di-
vision is rather arbitrary because the question of 
classifying certain acts as soft law or hard law 
remains completely unresolved. 

The indisputable fact is that the role of the 
philosophy of “soft law” in the regulation of in-
ternational relations is steadily growing. There 
are many advantages that are prompting subjects 
of international law to turn to “myakoplegal” 
means of regulation increasingly. In this context, 
soft law can really be viewed as an alternative to 
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the legal regulation of international relations pro-
per, which is now experiencing a crisis. It seems 
more justified to regulate relations at least with 
the help of soft law tools than futile attempts to 
force states to sign a legally binding international 
treaty. In addition to the exclusively practical 
result of obtaining a certain model of behaviour, 
the norms of soft law also play a certain function 
in international lawmaking. As a matter of fact, 
their education can constitute the first stage of 
the international law-making process, namely, 
the formation of norms, when a certain standard 
of behaviour is formed, which in the future (at 
the next stage of law-making) may become le-
gally binding. Soft law often plays an essential 
role in the process of international customs of 
lawmaking as evidence of the existence and con-
tent of international customs. As noted above, 
“soft law” consolidates and further strengthens 
“hard law”, helping it be a truly effective regula-
tor of international relations. 
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